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From: Bill Papas [bpapas@iugis.com]

Sent: 30/09/2020 03:58:57

To: michael_timpany@au.smbc.co.jp

CcC: Alex Colbert [acolbert@forumfinance.com.au]

Subject: FW: Notification acknowledgement

Attachments: _; ; ; ; ; ; ; C.htm; image003.png; image002.png; image004.png; image005.png; image006.png; scan2020-09-
30.pdf

Hi Mike

Thanks again for smooth process and below confirmation from CFO Preet Brar.

Cheers

Bill

[cid:image002.pngl@C01D69731.D5A3C5C0]

Bill Papas

CEO

P +61 2 9002 4000

Australia | New Zealand | United Kingdom | Greece | Germany | United Arab Emirates
iugis.com

[cid:image004.png@C1D69731.D5A3C5C0]

From: Brar, Preet <preet.brar@veolia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 30, 2020 1:43 PM

To: Bill Papas <bpapas@iugis.com>

Subject: Re: Notification acknowledgement

Hi Bill

I'm well but crazy dealing with budgets and planning now that Richard has arrived.
Unfortunately no holidays until the end of the year.

LK sent me the copies of the agreement so no issue and I confirm receipt of the letter.

Kind regards
Preet

Preet Brar | Chief Financial Officer | Veolia Australia and New Zealand

A: National Office | Level 4, 65 Pirrama Rd | Pyrmont | NSW |
2009<https://maps.google.com/?q=0ffice+%7C+Level+4, +65+Pirrama+Rd+%7C+Pyrmont+%7C+NSW+%7C
+2009&entry=gmail&source=g>

P: +61 (2) 8572 0331<tel:+61%202%208572%200331> | M: +61 (0) 408 268
651<tel:+61%20407%20069%20905> | E:
preet.brar@veolia.com<mailto:chris.godfrey@veolia.com>

[http://www.veolia.com/pics/Brand-bloc-EN.jpg]l<http://www.veolia.com/>

[http://www.veolia.com/pics/facebook-icon-5mm.jpgl<https://www.facebook.com/VeoliaANZ/>
[http://www.veolia.com/pics/linkedin-icon-5mm. jpg]
<https://www.linkedin.com/company/veolia-environnement-australia>
[http://www.veolia.com/pics/twitter-icon-5mm.jpg] <https://twitter.com/VeoliaANZ>
[http://www.veolia.com/pics/youtube-icon-5mnm. jpg]
<https://www.youtube.com/user/VeoliaESAU>

On Wed, 30 Sep. 2020 at 12:06PM, Bill Papas <bpapas@iugis.com> wrote:

Hi Preet,
Hope you’re well and maybe getting a small break with holidays this week.
In the absence of Laurie, the Agreement signed off last week on the Digestors, I have

attached the Notice of Assignment for completion purposes.

Could you please reply to this email receipt of this Notice and the attachment back to
me.

Thanks in advance,

Bill

H59935-0049-015592
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[cid:image005.pngl01D69731.D5A3C5CO]

Bill Papas

CEO

P +61 2 9002 4000

Australia | New Zealand | United Kingdom | Greece | Germany | United Arab Emirates

iugis.com
[cid:image006.pnglC1lD69731.D5A3C5CO]

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual
named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy
this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-
mall by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended
recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in
reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.

Message protected by MailGuard: e-mail anti-virus, anti-spam and content filtering.
http://www.mailguard.com.au

| e e e e B [ B

H59935-0049-015592





